
 

 

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 

IDAHO COUNTY, IDAHO 
DIGB 2 FIBER OPTIC PROJECT – OROFINO TO NEZPERCE 

General Notice. Idaho County (Owner) is requesting Bids for the construction of the following Project: 
DIGB 2 Fiber Optic Project – Orofino to Nezperce. Bids for the construction of the Project will be 
received at Idaho County Court House located at 320 W. Main Street, Grangeville, Idaho 83530 until 
Monday, June 23rd, 2025, at 4:00 p.m. local time. Bids received will be publicly opened and read aloud 
Tuesday, June 24th, 2025, at 9:30 a.m. at the Idaho County Courthouse during the Idaho County 
Commissioners Meeting. 

The Project includes the following Work: Installation of fiber optic line and conduit between the City of 
Orofino and the City of Nezperce.  

Obtaining the Bidding Documents. Complete digital project bidding documents are available at 
www.questcdn.com - Project Name: DIGB 2 Fiber Optic Project – Orofino to Nezperce, Project # 
9553579 and may be downloaded for a non-refundable fee.  Prospective bidders shall purchase digital 
documents from Quest CDN to receive addenda postings.  Please contact Quest CDN at 952-233-1632 or 
info@questcdn.com for assistance with digital project information.  Bids will only be accepted from 
bidders on the Quest CDN plan holders list. 

Documents may also be examined for free at J-U-B ENGINEERS, Inc., 846 6th St., Clarkston, WA 99403, 
(509)–254–6011 or on Quest CDN. 

Pre Bid – Non-Mandatory- Pre-bid conference will be held at the Nezperce City Hall, 606 Maple Street. 
Nezperce, ID 83543 on Wednesday, June 4th at 2:00 PM local time. A link for a virtual Microsoft Teams 
Meeting will be provided upon request. 

Instructions to Bidders. All bids must be signed and accompanied by evidence of authority to sign.  Bids 
must be accompanied by Bid Security in the form of a bid bond, certified check, cashiers’ check or cash in 
the amount of 5% of the amount of the bid proposal.  Said bid security shall be forfeited to the Owner as 
liquidated damages should the successful bidder fail to enter into contract in accordance with their 
proposal as specified in the Instructions to Bidders. Owner reserves the right to reject any or all proposals, 
waive any nonmaterial irregularities in the bids received, and to accept the proposal deemed most 
advantageous to the best interest of the Owner. 

This Advertisement is issued by: Idaho County, Kathy Ackerman, County Clerk, May 28th, 2025 and June 
4th,2025. 


